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Make Model Engine Engine Engine

S1 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 3.6L V6 N/A N/A
S1A1 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 41,085.00$                                  No Bid No Bid
S1A2 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 47,784.00$                                  No Bid No Bid
S1A3 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 43,885.00$                                  No Bid No Bid
S1A4 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 50,579.00$                                  

J1 Jeep Compass 2.0L Turbo N/A N/A
J1A1 Jeep Compass No Bid
J1A2 Jeep Compass No Bid
J1A3 Jeep Compass 30,113.00$                                  
J1A4 Jeep Compass 34,361.00$                                  

J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A
J2A1 Jeep Grand Cherokee 37,822.00$                                  No Bid
J2A2 Jeep Grand Cherokee 38,130.00$                                  No Bid
J2A3 Jeep Grand Cherokee 39,357.00$                                  No Bid
J2A4 Jeep Grand Cherokee 40,010.00$                                  No Bid

J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A
J2B1 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 39,357.00$                                  No Bid
J2B2 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 39,492.00$                                  No Bid
J2B3 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 41,237.00$                                  No Bid
J2B4 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 41,672.00$                                  No Bid

J3 Jeep Wagoneer Hurricane Twin Trubo 5.7 L V8 N/A
J3A1 Jeep Wagoneer 59,267.00$                                  No Bid
J3A2 Jeep Wagoneer 64,105.00$                                  No Bid
J3A3 Jeep Wagoneer 62,113.00$                                  No Bid
J3A4 Jeep Wagoneer 66,952.00$                                  No Bid

J4 Jeep Grand Wagoneer Hurricane Twin Trubo 5.7 L V8 N/A
J4A1 Jeep Grand Wagoneer No Bid No Bid
J4A2 Jeep Grand Wagoneer No Bid No Bid
J4A3 Jeep Grand Wagoneer 87,512.00$                                  No Bid
J4A4 Jeep Grand Wagoneer 98,083.00$                                  No Bid

J5 Jeep Gladiator 3.6L V6 3.0L Diesel N/A
J5A1 Jeep Gladiator No Bid No Bid

J5A2 Jeep Gladiator No Bid No Bid
J5A3 Jeep Gladiator No Bid No Bid
J5A4 Jeep Gladiator No Bid No Bid

J6 Jeep Wrangler 2.0L Turbo 3.0L Diesel 3.6L V6
J6A1 Jeep Wrangler No Bid No Bid No Bid
J6A2 Jeep Wrangler No Bid No Bid No Bid
J6A3 Jeep Wrangler No Bid No Bid 36,173.00$                                  
J6A4 Jeep Wrangler No Bid No Bid 39,218.00$                                  

total:
Bid tab was calculated by using vehicles that all bidders bidded on.

$1,078,307

Gene Steffy Auto Group

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that 

may have not been released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF 

CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5%
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R1 RAM 1500 5.7L Hemi 3.6L V6 N/A
R1A1 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1A2 RAM 1500 41,321.00$                                   38,611.00$                                   
R1A3 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1A4 RAM 1500 44,815.00$                                   42,105.00$                                   

R1 RAM 1500 5.7L Hemi 3.6L V6 N/A
R1B1 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1B2 RAM 1500 43,863.00$                                   41,153.00$                                   
R1B3 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1B4 RAM 1500 47,407.00$                                   44,697.00$                                   

R1 RAM 1500 5.7L Hemi 3.6L V6 N/A
R1C1 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1C2 RAM 1500 44,145.00$                                   No Bid
R1C3 RAM 1500 No Bid No Bid
R1C4 RAM 1500 47,692.00$                                   No Bid

R2 RAM 2500 5.7L Hemi 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2A1 RAM 2500 No Bid 41,065.00$                                   49,790.00$                                   
R2A2 RAM 2500 No Bid 43,599.00$                                   52,324.00$                                   
R2A3 RAM 2500 No Bid 43,713.00$                                   52,438.00$                                   
R2A4 RAM 2500 No Bid 46,250.00$                                   54,975.00$                                   

R2 RAM 2500 5.7L Hemi 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2B1 RAM 2500 No Bid 42,839.00$                                   51,564.00$                                   
R2B2 RAM 2500 No Bid 50,225.00$                                   58,950.00$                                   
R2B3 RAM 2500 No Bid 43,020.00$                                   51,745.00$                                   
R2B4 RAM 2500 No Bid 50,419.00$                                   59,142.00$                                   

R2 RAM 2500 5.7L Hemi 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2C1 RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R2C2 RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R2C3 RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R2C4 RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid

R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO
R3A1 RAM 3500 43,294.00$                                   52,019.00$                                   54,511.00$                                   
R3A2 RAM 3500 46,392.00$                                   56,117.00$                                   58,609.00$                                   
R3A3 RAM 3500 45,849.00$                                   54,574.00$                                   57,066.00$                                   
R3A4 RAM 3500 49,948.00$                                   58,673.00$                                   61,165.00$                                   
R3A5 RAM 3500 44,625.00$                                   53,350.00$                                   55,842.00$                                   
R3A6 RAM 3500 48,723.00$                                   57,448.00$                                   59,940.00$                                   
R3A7 RAM 3500 47,180.00$                                   55,905.00$                                   58,377.00$                                   
R3A8 RAM 3500 51,279.00$                                   60,004.00$                                   62,496.00$                                   

R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO
R3B1 RAM 3500 46,670.00$                                   55,395.00$                                   57,887.00$                                   
R3B2 RAM 3500 51,418.00$                                   60,143.00$                                   62,635.00$                                   
R3B3 RAM 3500 49,322.00$                                   58,047.00$                                   60,539.00$                                   
R3B4 RAM 3500 54,062.00$                                   62,787.00$                                   65,279.00$                                   
R3B5 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3B6 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3B7 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3B8 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid

R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO
R3C1 RAM 3500 46,850.00$                                   54,576.00$                                   58,068.00$                                   
R3C2 RAM 3500 51,599.00$                                   60,324.00$                                   62,816.00$                                   
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R3C3 RAM 3500 49,503.00$                                   58,228.00$                                   60,720.00$                                   
R3C4 RAM 3500 54,248.00$                                   62,973.00$                                   65,465.00$                                   
R3C5 RAM 3500 48,182.00$                                   56,907.00$                                   59,399.00$                                   
R3C6 RAM 3500 52,930.00$                                   61,655.00$                                   64,147.00$                                   
R3C7 RAM 3500 50,834.00$                                   59,559.00$                                   62,051.00$                                   
R3C8 RAM 3500 55,579.00$                                   64,304.00$                                   66,796.00$                                   

R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO
R3D1 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D2 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D3 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D4 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D5 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D6 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D7 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R3D8 RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid

total: $4,593,150
Bid tab was calculated by using vehicles that all bidders bidded on.

Provide a standard percentage 
(%) discount for additional 

Manufacturer Models not listed 
above or that may have not been 
released at the time of this bid.

5%
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